MARION COUNTY SHERIFF’S OFFICE
PURCHASING DIVISION

INVITATION TO BID/QUOTE

BID TERMS AND CONDITIONS

Phone: 352-368-3571 Fax: 352-369-6767

1. X A bid bond or cashier’s check is not required.
TO SEND U.S. MAIL:
P.O. BOX 1987 | 2. A bid bond in the form of a cashier’s or certified check is
OCALA, FL 34478 required and is attached for 5% of the amount of the bid.
Amount of check $

FED-EX OR HAND DELIVERY ONLY:
3290 NW 10* STREET, BLDG. 5 | 3. The successful bidder shall be required to submit a
OCALA, FL 34475 performance bond for 100% of the amount bid when
submitting a completed contract.

BID TITLE: GUN TRADE BID NUMBER: 23/24-0005

BIDS MUST BE RECEIVED NO LATER THAN: THURSDAY, MAY 30, 2024 AT: 2:00 P.M.

BIDDER ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

I CERTIFY THAT THIS BID IS MADE WITHOUT PRIOR UNDERSTANDING, AGREEMENT, OR CONNECTION
WITH ANY CORPORATION, FIRM, OR PERSON SUBMITTING A BID FOR THE SAME MATERIALS,
SUPPLIES, OR EQUIPMENT, AND IS IN ALL RESPECTS FAIR AND WITHOUT COLLUSION OR FRAUD. 1
AGREE TO ABIDE BY ALL CONDITIONS OF THIS BID AND CERTIFY THAT I AM AUTHORIZED TO SIGN
THIS BID FOR THE BIDDER. NOTE TO BIDDERS: THE UNDERSIGNED BIDDER DOES DECLARE THAT HE
HAS CAREFULLY EXAMINED THE SPECIFICATIONS AND CONDITIONS OF THE BID AND IS THROUGHLY
FAMILIAR WITH ITS PROVISIONS AND WITH THE QUALITY, TYPE AND GRADE OF MATERIALS
REQUIRED.

BIDDER MUST COMPLETE BELOW

VENDOR NAME:

Authorized Signature (manual)
VENDOR ADDRESS:

CITY - STATE - ZIP:

Authorized Signature (typed)

PHONE: FAX: EMAIL:

Title
IS ANY STOCKHOLDER OR MEMBER OF YOUR MANAGEMENT TEAM RELATED TO ANY EMPLOYEE OF THE MARION COUNTY

SHERIFF’S OFFICE? PLEASE STATE YES OR NO. IF YES, PLEASE STATE THEIR NAMES AND RELATIONSHIP:




INVITATION TO BID/QUOTE

GENERAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS

1. PREPARATION OF BIDS:

A. Bidders must submit bids on bid forms provided within the bid package and envelopes must be addressed with the self-addressed label enclosed.

B. Bidders are expected to examine the complete bid package and all attachments including drawings, specifications and instructions. Failure to do

so is at the bidder’s risk.

C. Bidders shall furnish information required by the solicitation in the form requested. The Sheriff reserves the right to reject bids with incomplete

information or which are presented in a different form.

D. If the item has a trade name, brand and/or catalog number, such shall be stated in the bid. If the bidder purposes to furnish an item of a different
manufacturer or vendor other than that specified, bidder must specify make, brand, quality, catalog number, or other trade designation. Unless such
is noted on the bid form it will be deemed that the article furnished is that designated, even though the bid may state “equal to or better than.”

. Time of delivery shall be stated in definite terms. If stated in a number of days, it shall include Saturdays, Sundays and holidays.
Samples, when required, shall be furnished prior to the closing date or within time specified in the bid. The Sheriff reserves the right to reject bids
submitted without required samples. Samples requested and submitted with a bid for analysis purposes will not be returned.

. All warranty and/or guarantee information on products bid must be included with the bid package on each item.

. Failure of a bidder to complete all required information, submit all required notarized forms or warranty/guarantee information may be cause for
rejection of a bid.
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2. SIGNATURES:
A. Bidders shall sign the invitation to bid or quote on all designated areas. Signatures shall be that of an agent authorized to sign such documents.
B. All erasures or other changes to the bid must be initialed by the person signing the bid.

3. SUBMISSION OF BIDS:
A. Bids must be returned in a sealed envelope with the orange address label provided in the bid package. Subsequent bid modifications must be
submitted in a sealed envelope addressed to the Sheriff’s Office and clearly marked with bid title, opening date and time on the face of the envelope.
B. Bids may be mailed U.S. mail to the P.O. Box listed above. All bids that are sent Fed-Ex, UPS or other designated express mail must be sent to the
street address listed above. Any bids sent express mail shall have the orange address label on the outside of the express envelope.
C. Bids received after specified date and time will be returned to the bidder unopened. The Marion County Sheriff’s Office will, in no way, be
responsible for delays caused by the U.S. Postal Service or any other delivery agent.

4. EXPIRATION OF BIDS:
A. By virtue of proposing the prices quoted and giving time for consideration, all bids shall be considered firm for a period of forty-five (45) days
following the date of the bid closing and expiring at midnight of the last day unless otherwise stated in the body of the bid. The bidder may state
a date that his/her bid expires, provided the date is specific and is entered on the bid sheet.

5. MODIFICATION OR WITHDRAWAL OF BID:

A. Bids may be modified or withdrawn by written notice received prior to the exact hour and date specified for receipt of the bid. A bid may also be
modified in person by a bidder or his/her authorized representative prior to the exact hour and date set for receipt of the bids. Telephone
withdrawals are not permitted.

B. If a solicitation is negotiated, bids may be modified or withdrawn by written notice received any time prior to award. Bids may be withdrawn in

person by a bidder or his/her authorized representative, provided his/her identity is made known, and he/she signs a receipt for the bid prior to the
award.

6. MISTAKES IN BID:

A. If the bidder discovers a mistake in the bid prior to the hour and date specified for receipt of the bid, he/she may correct the mistake by modifying or
withdrawing the bid in accordance with paragraph 5 above.

B. Ifthe apparent low and best bidder discovers a mistake in the bid of a serious and significant nature which is unfavorable to him/her prior to the
issuance of a purchase order or a contract, he/she may request consideration be given to modify the bid if he/she remains the lowest bidder, or to
withdraw the bid if the result of the correction of the mistake makes another bidder lowest and best bidder. The mistake must be evident and

provable.
The right is reserved by the Sheriff to reject any and all requests for correction of mistakes in bids received after the hour and date of the bid opening.
The decision of the Sheriff is final as regards to acceptance or rejection of requests for corrections of bids.

C. When unit prices and total prices on a bid form cannot be reconciled, the unit prices shall govern.

D. A mistake in a bid cannot be considered once a purchase order or a contract has been issued.

7. “NO BID” REPLY:
A. A respondent who is on the bid mailing list, but who decides not to submit a bid, must still respond by returning ONLY the Statement of No Bid
Form, marking it “No Bid”, and explaining the reason in the space provided.
B. Failure of a bidder to respond three (3) times in succession without justification shall be cause for removal of the bidder’s name from the bid mailing

list.



8. BID/PERFORMANCE BONDS:
A. A bid or performance bond shall be provided when specified by the terms of the invitation to bid or request for quotation. The amount shall be that
determined by the Sheriff to be reasonable and necessary to protect the best interests of the Sheriff’s Office.
B. Performance or bid bonds may be in the form of a surety bond, cashier’s check, endorsed certificate of deposit, money order or certified check drawn
on a solvent bank. Such bond or deposit shall be forfeited to the Sheriff in case the bidder shall fail or refuse to execute the contract.

9. BID TABULATIONS:
A. Bid tabulation sheets will automatically be sent to bidders that submitted a bid. Any other bidder desiring a copy of the tabulation sheet must make a
request through the Purchasing Division.
B. All bids will remain on file and available for review in the Purchasing Division of the Sheriff’s Office. Bidders must call to make an appointment to
review bid files.

10. BID AWARDS:

A. Bids will be analyzed and the award made to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder whose bid conforms to the solicitation and whose bid is
considered to be the most advantageous to the Sherift’s Office, price and other factors considered. The right to determine the foregoing is reserved
for the Sheriff and is not subject to appeal.

B. The Sheriff reserves the right to accept or reject any and all bids or any part of any bid; to waive informalities, irregularities, technical defects and to
select the bid deemed to be in the best interest of the Sheriff’s Office.

C. Bids received may be considered on an “all or none” basis or a line item basis and will be so designated in the bid package.

D. Upon acceptance of the bid by the Sheriff’s Office, and a purchase order issued to the successful bidder, shall be deemed to result in a binding
contract between the two parties without further action by either party. Items are to be furnished as described in the bid and in strict conformity with
all instructions, conditions, specifications, and drawings contained in the complete contract.

11. AWARD OF TIE BIDS:
A. A through review of all tie bids shall be conducted by the Purchasing Division. Award recommendations will be based as follows:
1. Delivery dates
2. Reputation of vendors involved
3. Past performance history
4. Location of vendor
5. Drug free workplace program — Per Section 287.087, Florida Statutes, preference will be given to businesses with Drug free work place programs.
B. Ifall factors and conditions relating to the bids are equal, then the tie bid will be awarded to the local bidder. If the other bidder is local, a coin toss
will be conducted by the Purchasing Division with at least one witness from outside the Purchasing Division.

12. NEXT LOW BIDDER:
A. In the event of a default by the awarded bidder, the Sheriff’s Office reserves the right to utilize the next low bidder as the awardee.
B. The next low bidder shall be required to provide the bid terms at the prices as contained in their bid for this specification for the remainder of
the award period.

13. DEVIATIONS OR EXCEPTIONS TO BID:
A. Bidders are hereby advised that the Sheriff’s Office will only consider bids that meet the specifications and other requirements imposed upon them
by this bid package.
B. Any deviations or exceptions to the bid must be so noted on the deviations/exceptions form enclosed within and returned with the bid package.
C. Failure by a bidder to detail each exception to a bid specification or requirement results in the bidder being required to meet each specification
or requirement exactly as stated.

14. DELIVERY:
A. All prices bid must be F.O0.B, Ocala, Marion County, Florida 34475.
B. All delivery dates, as specified in the bid, must be met.
C. All deliveries made against an order must be accompanied by a packing slip listing all items shipped

15. COLLUSION:
A. The bidder, by affixing his/her signature to this bid, agrees to the following: “Bidder certifies that his/her bid is made without previous
understanding, agreement, or connection with any corporation, firm, or person submitting a bid for the same materials, supplies or equipment
and is in all respects fair and without collusion or fraud or otherwise illegal action

16. “PIGGY-BACK” CLAUSE TO OTHER PUBLIC AGENCIES:
A. The bidder, by submitting a bid, authorizes other public agencies to “piggy-back”, or purchase equipment or services being proposed in this
invitation to bid at prices bid unless otherwise noted on the bid sheet.
B. It shall be the bidder’s responsibility to obtain billing information, purchase orders, and any other information required from agencies desiring to
utilize this bid.

17. CONTRACT DOCUMENTS:
A. Unless another form of contract is otherwise stipulated and executed, the bid package, along with subsequent purchase orders, constitutes an entire
legal and binding contract and agreement between the Marion County Sheriff’s Office and the successful bidder.
B. A new purchase order will be issued at the beginning of each new contract year, thereby constituting a renewal of the contract by each party.
C. If the successful bidder does not wish to renew the contract, said bidder must notify the Sheriff’s Office in writing no less than 30 days before the

expiration of the contract year.
-3-



18. CONTRACT CHANGES:

A. No changes over the contract award period shall be permitted without prior written approval of the Purchasing Director and confirmed through
formal correspondence of the Sheriff’s Office and the bidder.

19. CONTRACT CANCELLATION FOR DEFAULT:

20.

21.

22.

23.

24,

25.

A. Any award or contract executed from a bid is critical to the daily operation of the Marion County Sheriff' Office. It is incumbent upon the
successful bidder to carry out any obligation, term or condition of the contract. Failure to do so by the bidder constitutes default. Default may
be defined as any of the following:

1. The contractor provides material that does not meet the specifications of the contract.

2. The contractor fails to adequately perform the services set forth in the specifications of the contract.

3. The contractor fails to complete the work required or furnish the materials required within the time stipulated in the contract.

4. The contractor fails to make progress in the performance of the contract and/or gives reason to believe that the contractor will not or cannot
perform the requirements of the contract.

B. The Marion County Sheriff’s Office may resort to any single or combination of the following remedies:

1. Cancel any contract.

2. Reserve all rights or claims to damage for breach of any covenants of the contract.

3. Perform any test or analysis on materials for compliance with the specifications of the contract. If the results of any test or analysis find a
material noncompliant with the specifications, the actual expense of testing will be borne by the contractor.

C. In case of default, the Sheriff’s Office reserves the right to purchase materials and/or services to complete the required work in accordance with the
needs of the Sheriff’s Office. The Sheriff’s Office may recover any actual excess costs from the contractor by:

1. Deduction from any unpaid balances.
2. Collection against the bid or performance bond.
3. Any combination of the above or any other remedies as provided by the law.

D. When deemed to be in the best interest of the Marion County Sheriff’s Office, unless otherwise stipulated, any contract resulting from a bid may be
cancelled by the following means.

1. Ten (10) day’s written notice with cause.
2. Thirty (30) day’s written notice without cause.

PURCHASE ORDERS:
A. All goods and services will be ordered by means of a purchase order. The Sheriff’s Office will not be responsible for articles or services furnished
without a purchase order.

PRICES, TERMS AND PAYMENT:

A. Timely payment of invoices is incumbent upon the Marion County Sheriff’s Office and in no case shall payment exceed forty-five (45) days from
receipt of an invoice.

B. The bidder shall be paid upon submission of a proper invoice to the Fiscal Division of the Marion County Sheriff’s Office at the prices stipulated by
the bid award. Payment terms are thirty (30) days net, unless otherwise stipulated by a prompt payment discount. All invoices must contain the
purchase order number by which the order was placed.

C. Prices bid are firm and final. All prices bid shall reflect any available discounts offered, except timely payment. All prices are F.O.B. destination as

specified in the bid. All shipping, packing, and drayage charges are the responsibility of the bidder.

. Discounts for prompt payment may be considered in determining the lowest net cost for bid evaluation purposes.

The Marion County Sheriff’s Office is a tax exempt agency and does not pay Federal Excise tax or State sales tax. Taxes shall not be included in
invoices or in bid prices. The Sheriff’s Office tax exemption number appears on the face of the purchase order.

™o

CONDITION AND PACKAGING:
A. Tt shall be understood and agreed that any item offered and shipped as a result of a bid shall be new and most current model at the time of the bid.
B. All containers shall be suitable for shipment and storage and all prices shall include standard commercial packaging.

SAFETY STANDARDS:

A. Unless otherwise stipulated in the bid, all manufactured items and fabricated assemblies shall comply with applicable requirements of the
Federal Occupational Safety and Health Act (OSHA), American National Standards Institute of Safety Standards and any Florida standards
there under.

GOVERNMENTAL RESTRICTIONS:

A. In the event any governmental restrictions may be imposed which would necessitate alteration of the material, quality, workmanship, or
performance of the items or services offered in the bid prior to their delivery, it shall be the responsibility of the bidder to immediately notify
the Purchasing Director indicating the specific regulation which required the alteration.

B. The Marion County Sheriff’s Office reserves the right to accept any such alteration, including any price adjustments, or to cancel the contract
at no expense to the Sheriff’s Office.

COMPLIANCE WITH OTHER LAWS:

A. Applicable provisions of all federal, state and local laws and ordinances, and all Purchasing rules and regulations shall govern the quality and
warranty of commodities covered by all bids received, and shall govern any and all claims and disputes between person(s) submitting a bid
response, by and through its officers, employees and authorized representatives, or any other person, natural or otherwise; and lack of knowledge
by any bidder shall not constitute a cognizable defense against the legal effect thereof.
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26

27

28

29

30

31

32

. RULES, REGULATIONS, LAWS ORDINANCES AND LICENSES:

A. The successful bidder agrees that he/she shall observe and obey all the laws, ordinances, regulations and rules of the federal, state, county and

Purchasing which may be applicable to its services. Likewise, shall obtain and maintain all permits and licenses necessary for its performance
of a contract.

. MANDATORY REQUIREMENTS AND INSPECTION:

A. Bidders are required to maintain a permanent place of business and maintain adequate equipment, personnel and inventory to adequately and

expeditiously furnish services and/or supplies ordered under an awarded bid.

B. The Marion County Sheriff’s Office reserves the right to inspect the place of business and equipment of a bidder before awarding a contract or

anytime thereafter during the course of the contract.

. MATERIAL SAFETY DATA SHEETS:

A. In accordance with Chapter 442, Florida Statutes, it is the seller’s duty to advise the buyer if a product is a listed toxic substance and to provide a

material safety data sheet (MSDS) at the time of delivery.

B. Bidders must comply with above procedure along with the Florida Right-to-Know law (F.S. 442) and the Federal Hazard Communications Standards

(29 CFR 1910.1200) and all other applicable laws.

. NON-FUNDING CLAUSE:
A. In the event sufficient budgeted funds are not available, the Sheriff’s Office shall notify the bidder of such event and the contract shall terminate

without penalty or expense to either party.

. PUBLIC ENTITY CRIMES:

A. A person or affiliate who has been placed on the convicted vendor list following a conviction for public entity crime may not submit a bid or

contract to provide goods or services to a public entity, may not submit a bid or contract with a public entity for the construction or repair of a
public building or public work, may not submit bids on leases on real property to a public entity, may not be awarded or perform work as a
contractor, supplier, subcontractor, or consultant under a contract with any public entity, and may not transact business with any public entity

in excess of the threshold amount provided in Section 287.017, Florida Statutes, for category two, for a period of 36 months from the date of being
placed on the convicted vendor list.

. E-VERIFY:

A. The successful bidder agrees to comply with Section 448.095, Florida Statutes, which includes the requirement that persons or entities register

with and use the E-Verify System if the person or entity is entering or attempting to enter into a contract with a public employer to provide
labor, supplies or services in exchange for salary, wages, or other renumeration.

. SCRUTINIZED COMPANIES:

A. All bidders agree to comply with Section 287.135, Florida Statutes, which includes the provision that a company is ineligible to, and may not,

bid on, submit a proposal for, or enter into or renew a contract with an agency or local governmental entity for goods or services of:

(a) Any amount if, at the time of bidding on, submitting a proposal for, or entering into or renewing such contract, the company is on the
Scrutinized Companies that Boycott Israel List, created pursuant to s. 215.4725, or is engaged in a boycott of Israel; or (b) One million
dollars or more if, at the time of bidding on, submitting a proposal for, or entering into or renewing such contract, the company:

(1) Is on the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in Sudan List or the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in the Iran Petroleum
Energy Sector List, created pursuant to s. 215.473; or, (2) Is engaged in business operations in Cuba or Syria. By placing a bid or
proposal, the bidder certifies (a) it is not participating in a boycott of Israel, and (b) if the bid is for goods or services of $1 million or more,
that it is not on the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in Sudan List or the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in the Iran Petroleum
Energy Sector List and that it does not have business operations in Cuba or Syria.

33. DRUG FREE WORKPLACE AFFIDAVIT:

A. Pursuant to Section 893.02 (4), Florida Statutes, each bidder shall complete the form on the Drug Free Workplace Affidavit and submit with the bid

package.

34. INDEMNIFICATION CLAUSE:

A. The successful bidder agrees, by accepting the award of this contract, to the following “Hold Harmless Agreement.”

During the term of this contract, the vendor shall indemnify, hold harmless, and defend the Marion County Sheriff’s Office, Ocala, Florida, its
agents, servants, and employees from any and all costs and expenses including but not limited to attorney’s fees, reasonable investigative and
discovery costs, court costs, and all other sums which the Marion County Sheriff’s Office, its agents, servants, and employees may pay or become
obligated to pay on account of any, all and every claim or demand, or assertion of liability, or any claim or action founded thereon, arising or alleged
to have risen out of the products, goods, or services furnished by the vendor, his agents, servants, or employees, or any of his equipment when such
persons or equipment are on premises owned or controlled by the Marion County Sheriff’s Office, for the purpose of performing services, delivering
products or goods, installing equipment or otherwise transacting business, whether such claim or claims be for damages, injury to person, group or
organization, whether employed by the vendor or the Marion County Sheriff’s Office or otherwise.
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35.

36.

37.

38.

39.

FINANCIAL STATEMENTS:
A. Some specialized bids may require bidders to provide certified financial statements for a specified period of time. In the event statements are
required, it will be so requested under “Special Conditions” in the bid package.

INSURANCE:
A. Some specialized bids may require bidders to provide proof of certain types and limits of insurance coverage. In the event insurance is required,
it will be so requested under “Special Conditions” in the bid package.

REFERENCES:

A. Some specialized bids may require bidders to provide a list of references. In the event references are required, it will be so requested under
“Special Conditions” in the bid package.

ESCALATION:

A. Escalation provisions are not permitted unless otherwise stipulated in the bid package.

BID OPENINGS:

A. All bid openings are open to the general public as well as bidders submitting a bid.

B. Bids shall be opened on the date and time specified on the bid form.

C. Itis the bidder’s sole responsibility to assure that his/her bid is delivered before the specified date and time of opening.

D. Bids that are received after the specified date and time of opening will not be considered and will be returned to the bidder unopened.



INVITATION TO BID
BID NUMBER 23/24-0005

Sealed bids will be received by BILLY WOODS, Sheriff, Marion County, Florida until
2:00 P.M., Thursday, May 30, 2024, for a trade type bid of used guns in exchange for
new handguns. Bids will be opened and read aloud on the same date at 2:15 P.M., or as
soon thereafter as practical. The official time shall be determined by the time and
temperature telephone number 352-629-1212.

Bids are to be submitted to Wendy Blaznik, Purchasing Director, Marion County

Sheriff’s Office, located at 692 NW 30" Avenue, Ocala, Florida 34475, telephone
number 352-368-3571.

SPECIAL CONDITIONS

1. This is a trade type bid. The new handguns desired must be traded
towards the used firearms listed herein.

2. A copy of your current Federal firearms license must be submitted with the bid.

3. All items bid must be delivered within thirty (30) days after receipt of the purchase
order.

4. Traded firearms will not be released to the successful bidder until all new handguns
are received by the Marion County Sheriff’s Office. All traded firearms
must be removed from the Sheriff’s Office within ten (10) working days after all new
handguns are received.

5. None of the firearms to be traded are guaranteed. There is no express or implied
warranty. The descriptions given are based on our best knowledge, but even the
description is not guaranteed. Firearms will be traded “as is” and it is the
responsibility of each bidder to inspect the items before submitting a bid. The attached
gun trade list is considered to be accurate, but may be plus or minus a gun or two at
the time of actual trade. The Marion County Sheriff’s Office reserves the right to
adjust this list as necessary to compensate for any discrepancies.

6. The majority of the firearms on the attached list have not been disassembled.
7. Prices on the new handguns shall remain in effect for a period of three

(3) months from the date of award in the event the Marion County Sheriff’s Office
desires to purchase additional new handguns.



8. The firearms to be traded may be inspected at the Marion County Sheriff’s Office,
3290 NW 10" Street, Bldg 5, Ocala, Florida, on Thursday, May 23, 2024 between
the hours of 1:00 P.M. and 4:00 P.M. This is the only date firearms may be
inspected. NO EXCEPTIONS TO THIS DATE AND TIME WILL BE MADE.

9. Only licensed gun dealers or employees with a written letter of authorization may
inspect the firearms. A copy of the most current Federal firearms license must be
shown to gain entry.

10. The award of this bid will be made on an all or none basis to the bidder with the
lowest bottom line cost to the Sheriff’s Office.



BID FORM
BID 23/24-0005

1. Thirty (30) each, Glock 43 handguns, chambered in 9mm with black finish, a 3.41”
length barrel, with Glock night sights, standard 5.5 Ib. trigger and 2 each, 6 round
magazines.

UNIT PRICE $

2. Remainder: In Glock 17°s Gen 5, chambered in 9mm with black finish, a 4.49”
length barrel, with Glock night sights, standard 5.5 Ib trigger and 3 each, 17 round
magazines.

UNIT PRICE $

Trade-in value of firearms: $
(As per attached list)

(Note — the quantity of handguns purchased will be determined
by the trade-in value of the firearms listed for trade.)



BID FORM
BID 23/24-0005

FIRM NAME

(please print)

FIRM ADDRESS

AUTHORIZED AGENT

(please print)

AGENT’S SIGNATURE

TELEPHONE FAX

EMAIL DATE

FEDERAL FIREARMS LICENSE NUMBER

(copy must be attached)



STATEMENT OF “NO BID”

GUN TRADE
BID NUMBER 23/24-0005

If you do not intend to bid on this proposal, please complete and return this form prior to
the date shown for receipt of bids to: Marion County Sheriff’s Office, Purchasing
Division, P. O. Box 1987, Ocala, Florida 34478.

WE, THE UNDERSIGNED, HAVE DECLINED TO BID ON YOUR BID NO.
OPENING , FOR FOR THE FOLLOWING
REASONS:

Specifications are too “tight”, i.e., geared toward one brand or
manufacturer only. (please explain below)

Insufficient time to respond to the invitation to bid.

We do not offer this product(s) or equivalent.

(please remove us from your bid list for this product)

Our product schedule would not permit us to perform.

Unable to meet specifications.

Unable to meet bond requirements.

Unable to meet insurance requirements.

Specifications unclear. (please explain below)

Competition restricted by pre-approved specifications and standards
of the Marion County Sheriff’s Office.

Other (please explain below)

REMARKS:

WE UNDERSTAND THAT IF THIS “NO BID” LETTER IS NOT EXECUTED AND RETURNED, OUR NAME MAY BE
REMOVED FROM THE LIST OF QUALIFIED BIDDERS FOR THE MARION COUNTY SHERIFF’S OFFICE. VENDORS
WILL BE REMOVED FROM THE ACTIVE BIDDERS LIST AFTER RECEIPT OF THREE “NO BID” STATEMENTS.

FIRM NAME
(please print)
FIRM ADDRESS
AUTHORIZED AGENT & TITLE
(please print)
AGENT’S SIGNATURE
TELEPHONE FAX

EMAIL DATE




DEVIATION/EXCEPTION FORM
GUN TRADE
BID NUMBER 23/24-0005

The undersigned understands that this bid proposal must be signed in ink and that any
unsigned bid proposal will be considered incomplete and subject to rejection by the
Marion County Sheriff’s Office.

SUBJECT TO DEVIATIONS STATED BELOW, THE UNDERSIGNED, BY THE
SIGNATURE EVIDENCED, REPRESENTS THAT THE BIDDER ACCEPTS THE
TERMS, CONDITIONS, MANDATES AND OTHER PROVISIONS OF THE
FOREGOING INSTRUCTIONS, CONDITIONS AND SPECIAL PROVISIONS, SAID
DOCUMENTS BEING THE STRICT BASIS UPON WHICH THE SAID BIDDER
MAKES THE PROPOSAL.

*******************TYPE OR USE INK ONLY********************
All the following information must be here upon given for this bid proposal to be
considered by the Marion County Sheriff’s Office.

The following represents every deviation, itemized by number, to the

foregoing instructions, conditions and special provisions upon which
this bid proposal is based, to wit:

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE



DRUG FREE WORKPLACE CERTIFICATE

I, the undersigned, in accordance with Florida Statute 287.087, hereby certify that,

(print or type name of firm)

¢ Publishes a written statement notifying that the unlawful manufacture, distribution, dispensing,
possession or use of a controlled substance is prohibited in the workplace named above, and specifying
actions that will be taken against violations of such prohibition.

¢ Informs employees about the dangers of drug abuse in the workplace, the firm’s policy of maintaining
a drug free working environment, and available drug counseling, rehabilitation, and employee
assistance programs, and the penalties that may be imposed upon employees for drug use violations.

¢ Gives each employee engaged in providing commodities or contractual services that are under bid or
proposal, a copy of the statement specified above.

¢ Notifies the employees that as a condition of working on the commodities or contractual services that
are under bid or proposal, the employee will abide by the terms of the statement and will notify the
employer of any conviction of, plea of guilty or nolo contendere to, any violation of Chapter 1893, or
of any controlled substance law of the State of Florida or the United States, for a violation occurring in
the workplace, no later than five (5) days after such conviction, and requires employees to sign copies
of such written statement to acknowledge their receipt.

¢ Imposes a sanction on, or requires the satisfactory participation in a drug abuse assistance or
rehabilitation program, if such is available in the employee’s community, by any employee who is so
convicted.

¢ Makes a good faith effort to continue to maintain a drug free workplace through the implementation of
the drug free workplace program.

As a person authorized to sign this statement, I certify that the above named business, firm or corporation
complies fully with the requirements set forth herein.

Authorized Signature

Date Signed

State of

County of

Sworn to and subscribed before me this day of ,20
Personally known or Produced identification

(specify type of identification)

Signature of Notary

My commission expires




SWORN STATEMENT PURSUANT TO SECTION 287.133(3)(a),
FLORIDA STATUTES, ON PUBLIC ENTITY CRIMES

THIS FORM MUST BE SIGNED AND SWORN TO IN THE PRESENCE OF A NOTARY PUBLIC OR OTHER OFFICIAL
AUTHORIZED TO ADMINISTER OATHS.

1. This sworn statement is submitted to Marion County Sheriff’s Office by

(print individual’s name and title)

for

(print name of entity submitting sworn statement)

whose business address is

and if applicable, its Federal Employer Identification Number (FEIN) is

If the entity has no FEIN, include the social security number of the individual signing this sworn
statement

2. Tunderstand that a “public entity crime” as defined in Paragraph 287.133(1)(g), Florida Statutes, means
a violation of any state or federal law by a person with respect to and directly related to the transaction
of business with any public entity or with an agency or political subdivision of any other state or of the
United States, including, but not limited to, any bid or contract for goods or services to be provided to
any public entity or an agency or political subdivision of any other state or of the Unites States and
involving antitrust, fraud, theft, bribery, collusion, racketeering, conspiracy, or material
misrepresentation.

3. Tunderstand that “convicted” or “conviction” as defined in Paragraph 287.133(1)(b), Florida Statutes,
means a finding of guilt or a conviction of a public entity crime, with or without an adjudication of
guilt, in any federal or state trial court of record relating to charges brought by indictment or
information after July 1, 1989, as a result of a jury verdict, non-jury trial, or entry of a plea of guilty or
nolo contendere.

4. T understand that an “affiliate” as defined in Paragraph 287.133(1)(e), Florida Statutes, means:

1. A predecessor or successor of a person convicted of a public entity crime; or

2. An entity under the control of any natural person who is active in the management of the entity and
who has been convicted of a public entity crime. The term “affiliate” includes those officers,
directors, executives, partners, shareholders, employees, members, and agents who are active in the
management of an affiliate. The ownership by one person of shares constituting a controlling interest
in another person, or a pooling of equipment or income among persons when not for fair market
value under an arm’s length agreement, shall be a prima facie case that one person controls another
person. A person who knowingly enters into a joint venture with a person who has been convicted
of a public entity crime in Florida during the preceding 36 months shall be considered an affiliate.

5. Tunderstand that a “person” as defined in Paragraph 287.133(1)(e), Florida Statutes, means any natural
person or entity organized under the laws of any state or of the United States with the legal power to
enter into a binding contract and which bids or applies to bid on contracts for the provision of goods or
services let by a public entity, or which otherwise transacts or applies to transact business with a public
entity. The term “person” includes those officers, directors, executives, partners, shareholders,
employees, members and agents who are active in management of an entity.



6. Based on information and belief, the statement which I have marked below is true in relation to the
entity submitting this sworn statement. (Indicate which statement applies.)

Neither the entity submitting this sworn statement, nor any of its officers, directors, executives,
partners, shareholders, employees, members, or agents who are active in the management of the entity, nor any
affiliate of the entity has been charged with and convicted of a public entity crime subsequent to July 1, 1989.

The entity submitting this sworn statement, or one or more of its officers, directors, executives,
partners, shareholders, employees, members, or agents who are active in the management of the entity, or an
affiliate of the entity has been charged with and convicted of a public entity crime subsequent to July 1, 1989.

The entity submitting this sworn statement, or one or more of its officers, directors, executives,
partners, shareholders, employees, members, or agents who are active in the management of the entity, or an
affiliate of the entity has been charged with and convicted of a public entity crime subsequent to July 1, 1989.
However, there has been a subsequent proceeding before a Hearing Officer of the State of Florida, Division of
Administrative Hearings and the final order entered by the Hearing Officer determined that it was not in the public
interest to place the entity submitting this sworn statement on the convicted vendor list. (attach a copy of the final
order.)

I UNDERSTAND THAT THE SUBMISSION OF THIS FORM TO THE CONTRACT OFFICER FOR THE PUBLIC
ENTITY IDENTIFIED IN PARAGRAPH 1 (ONE) ABOVE IS FOR THAT PUBLIC ENTITY ONLY AND THAT THIS
FORM IS VALID THROUGH DECEMBER 31 OF THE CALENDAR YEAR IN WHICH IT IS FILED. I ALSO
UNDERSTAND THAT I AM REQUIRED TO INFORM THE PUBLIC ENTITY PRIOR TO ENTERING INTO A
CONTRACT IN EXCESS OF THE THRESHOLD AMOUNT PROVIDED IN SECTION 287.017, FLORIDA STATUTES,
FOR CATEGORY TWO OF ANY CHANGE IN THE INFORMTION CONTAINED IN THIS FORM.

(signature)
Sworn to and subscribed before me this day of , 20
Personally known
or produced identification Notary Public — State of

My commission expires

(type of identification)

(printed, typed or stamped commissioned
name of notary public)
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056301 R FLE, MARLI N GLENFI ELD 22 CALI BER SEM AUTO 22410807 UA W 11/30/2023
056302 R FLE, KEL TEC .40 CAL E3926 UA W 11/30/2023
056303 Rl FLE, RUGER 10/22 22 CALIBER SEM AUTO 11193962 UA W 11/ 30/ 2023
056304 RI FLE, MARLI N 30-30 CALI BER 71250901 UA W 11/ 30/ 2023
056305 SHOTGUN, MOSSBERG BLACK R260209 UA W 11/30/2023
056306 R FLE, MOSSBERG .22 CALI BER LONG BLACK ELE3390239 UA W 11/30/2023
056307 R FLE, OWNI .223 ASSAULT NS111013 UA W 11/30/2023
056311 HANDGUN, RUGER SECURI TY SI X 357 CALI BER REVOLV 15948097 UA W 11/ 30/ 2023
056312 HANDGUN, TAURUS PT738 380 CALI BER SEM AUTO 64944B UA W 11/30/2023
056313 HANDGUN, RUGER P89 BLACK 31668252 UA W 11/30/2023
056314 HANDGUN, SM TH&WESSON BLACK 9WM HNV3737 UA W 11/30/2023
056316 HANDGUN, COLT PYTHON 357 REVOLVER V63128 UA W 11/ 30/ 2023
056318 HANDGUN, TAURUS . 38 SPECI AL REVOLVER BLACK ul39942 UA W 11/ 30/2023
056319 HANDGUN, ARMSCOR ROCK | SLAND TCM 1911 9MM TCMD00414 UA W 11/30/2023
056320 HANDGUN, SCCY 9MM 761587 UA W 11/30/2023
056322 HANDGUN, FN HERSTAL 386146578 UA W 11/ 30/2023
056323 HANDGUN, BERETTA MPAl BER684485 UA W 11/ 30/2023
056324 HANDGUN, GLOCK 9 MM SFW62 UA W 11/30/2023
056325 HANDGUN, TAURUS PT738 37148B UA W 11/30/2023
056326 HANDGUN, LORCI N 380 CALI BER SEM AUTO 343490 UA W 11/ 30/2023
056327 HANDGUN, RUGER . 38 SPECI AL LCR REVOLVER BLACK 540- 43101 UA W 11/ 30/ 2023
056328 HANDGUN, GLOCK SEM AUTO BLACK BHTB833 UA W 11/30/2023
056329 HANDGUN, COLT HANDGUN SEM AUTO PL110628 UA W 11/30/2023
056330 HANDGUN, RUGER PI NK CAMO SEM AUTO 371685356 UA W 11/ 30/2023
056333 HANDGUN, SM TH & WESSON SEM AUTO MPE3224 UA W 11/ 30/ 2023
056334 HANDGUN, TAURUS SEM AUTO TIWW1240 UA W 11/ 30/2023
056335 HANDGUN, GLOCK 19 GEN 5 SEM AUTO BLACK BFLW)80 UA W 11/30/2023
056336 HANDGUN, GLOCK 19 9WMM SEM AUTO SDA973 UA W 11/ 30/ 2023
056337 HANDGUN, SI NGLE STACK SEM AUTO BBXY845 UA W 11/ 30/ 2023
056338 HANDGUN, GLOCK 42 SEM AUTO ACVR762 UA W 11/ 30/2023
056340 R FLE, RUGER 10/22 .22LR 23382754U UA W 11/30/2023
056341 HANDGUN, DRACO 7.62 SEM AUTO PE2743- 2018RO UA W 11/ 30/ 2023
056343 RI FLE, W NCHESTER BROWN 177951A UA W 11/ 30/ 2023
056345 SHOTGUN, MOSSBERG 12 GA. L725637 UA W 11/30/2023
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056346 SHOTGUN, Rz17 METALLI C GREEN 20P9311 UA W 11/ 30/ 2023
056347 Rl FLE, .308 CALI BER ASSAULT PF046892 UA W 11/30/ 2023
056348 RI FLE, DI AMOND BACK AR-15 DB15 DB1566849 UA W 11/ 30/ 2023
056349 RI FLE, 22 CALI BER BLACK EMF3799226 UA W 11/ 30/ 2023
056350 RI FLE, THE MARLI NS FI REARMS . 22 MAG HUNTI NG MVL9451D UA W 11/ 30/ 2023
056351 HANDGUN, TAURUS SEM AUTO BLACK TIJR60602 UA W 11/30/ 2023
056352 HANDGUN, COLT .38 REVOLVER CHROVE 8422453 UA W 11/ 30/ 2023
056353 HANDGUN, GLOCK 26 SEM AUTO RLF129 UA W 11/ 30/ 2023
056354 HANDGUN, TAURUS PT 738 SEM AUTO 69082B UA W 11/ 30/ 2023
056355 HANDGUN, GLOCK 19 AAKE491 UA W 11/30/ 2023
056356 HANDGUN, GLOCK 19 BSKMB67 UA W 11/ 30/ 2023
056357 HANDGUN, KELTEC .32 CAL SEM AUTO 89040 UA W 11/ 30/ 2023
056359 HANDGUN, SPRI NGFI ELD XD BLACK XD715589 UA W 11/ 30/ 2023
056360 HANDGUN, SM TH & WESSON 9wMM SEM AUTO SI LVER TDB1423 UA W 11/30/ 2023
056363 HANDGUN, RUGER 38 CAL REVOLVER 154081569 UA W 11/ 30/ 2023
056364 HANDGUN, PALMETO DAGGER COVPACTS 9WM BLACK FQ37963 UA W 11/ 30/ 2023
056365 HANDGUN, TAURUS 9MM SEM AUTO BLACK TFU74712 UA W 11/30/ 2023
056371 HANDGUN, FN FI VE- SEVEN 386191971 UA W 11/30/ 2023
056535 RUGER 22 CALI BER SEM AUTO RI FLE W1 MAGAZI NE 11902548 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
056539 COVWWANDO MARK | I'l 45 CALI BER SEM AUTO RI FLE W 08501 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
056540 SKS 7.62 SEM AUTO RI FLE W2 MAGAZI NES 1508990 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
056545 SAVAGE BOLT ACTI ON RI FLE CHAMBERED I N 30-06 (A34342 UA W 04/02/ 2024
056547 THUNDER FI VE 410/ 45 CALI BER REVOLVER W5 SHOT 1543 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
056549 CORBAY M 11 9MM SEM AUTO HANDGUN W 1 MAGAZI NE 890013537 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
056550 RUGER 44 CALI BER REVOLVER W6 AMMO 8148140 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
056551 RUGER 45 CALI BER REVOLVER W 6 AMMO 4611073 UA W 04/02/ 2024
056555 SM TH & WESSON . 40CAL DwW1904 UA W 04/02/ 2024
056557  RUGER LCP MAX . 380 FI REARM 381330861 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
056558 CHARTER ARMS 38 CAL REVOLVER 466577 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
056560 S&W . 357 SN N379273 12/ 10 GA HANDGUN N379273 UA W 04/02/ 2024
056561 WALTHER 9MM S055875 UA W 04/02/ 2024
056566 ARMSCOR 38 CALI BER REVOLVER AP236571 UA W 04/02/ 2024
056567 RUGER LCP 380 HANDGUN W1 MAGAZI NE 371172859 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
056568 ROSSI  38Cal J084756 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
056569 RUGER 45 CALI BER SEM AUTO HANDGUN 30839863 UA W 04/02/ 2024
056570 SI LVER .45 ACP AMI W MAG DL18629 UA W 04/02/ 2024
056573 FI REARM # 1 TATI CAL SOQUULTI ONS . 22 655NWL6993 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
056574 6135-11- BLACK SM TH AND WESSOCN . 38 SPECI AL 20D4715 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
056577 MOSSBERG 12 GAUGE PUMP SHOTGUN L329142 UA W 04/02/ 2024
056578 DPM5 223 CALI BER SEM AUTO RI FLE FH176143 UA W 04/02/ 2024
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056579 STURM RUGER 223 CALI BER SEM AUTO RI FLE 18596409 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
056580 STCEGER 12 GAUGE SEM AUTO SHOTGUN 635012 UA W 04/02/ 2024
056581 ROVARMS 7. 62 X 39 CALIBER SEM ATUO RI FLE S1620612002 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
056582 MARLI N 22 CALI BER SEM AUTO Rl FLE W SCOPE 23350632 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
056583 MOSSBERG 12 GAUGE PUWP SHOTGUN MW32026N UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
056584 MOSSBERG 12 GAUGE PUMP SHOTGUN MW87673M UA W 04/02/ 2024
056585 MOSSBERG 12 GAUGE PUWMP SHOTGUN MV32483N UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
056588 MOSSBERG 12 GA SEM - AUTO, MODEL-5500 MWK || 041432 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
056596 W NCHESTER 30- 30 CALI BER LEVER ACTI ON RI FLE 6074799 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
056599 MARLI N 22 CALI BER SEM AUTO Rl FLE W SCOPE 91480273 UA W 04/02/ 2024
056604 KEL- TEC 12 GAUGE SHOTGUN XEB61 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
056605 GLOCK 40 CALI BER SEM AUTO HANDGUN CDS208US UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
056606 SM TH & WESSON 9MM SEM AUTO HANDGUN PDW408 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
056607 TAURUS 357 CALI BER REVOVLER 5151894 UA W 04/02/ 2024
056608 COLT 44 CALI BER REVOLVER MV42927 UA W 04/02/ 2024
056610 NORTH AMERI CAN FI REARMS 22 CALI BER REVOLVER W84180 UA W 04/02/ 2024
056613 SM TH & WESSON . 38 SPCL 486387 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
056614 GLOCK 17 W MAGAZI NE AND 50 ROUND DRUM BGFA549 UA W 04/02/ 2024
056617 SM TH AND WESSON M&P 9 SHI ELD RIC4255 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
056618 TAN GLOCK 19X SEM - AUTOVATI C HANDGUN, 9MM BPNY528 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
056619 COLT .38 SPECI AL F30254 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
056622 6308-1 RUGER 9WMM LC9 32904701 UA W 04/02/ 2024
056624 SM TH AND WESSON 40 CAL HANDGUN HLF7761 UA W 04/02/ 2024
056625 SM TH AND WESSON . 357 REVOLVER 9K65395 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
056631 BERETTA 380 CALI BER PCOr0793 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
056632 RUGER 9MM GUN 38236479 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56541 NEW ENGLAND FI REARMS 20 GAUGE SI NGLE SHOTGUN NC270452 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56544 RUGER / 1022 / RIFLE / .22 / BLACK AND SI LVER 0004- 21749 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56671 Ruger 214-94513 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
56674 d ock PZMB70 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56675 Taur us TJZ84433 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56676 Smith & Wesson 629799 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
56677 SCCY 207050 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
56679 Smith & Wesson HzZC0668 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
56680 FNH CSu0021134 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56681 G ock LPB849 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
56682 Cobr ay 12-0014274 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
56686 Taur us ACQD82106 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
56687 Taur us ABKO000933 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56688 SCCY 906870 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
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56689 d ock LK384US UA W 04/02/ 2024
56690 Snmith & Wesson FW.7079 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56691 Col t A69564 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56692 d ock BLDO84US UA W 04/02/ 2024
56693 Chi appa 16A00762 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56696 Taur us 10125100 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56697 Taur us M290487 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56700 Taur us ACE 872938 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56701 Smth & Wesson CVEO273 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56702 Wl t her L220683 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56704 Kel Tec AL280 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56705 Smith & Wesson DSM4A013 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56707 Hi gh Standard 1021826 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
56708 Br owni ng 655PT11010 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56712 Snith & Wesson 1D74713 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
56714 Smith and Wesson CUY6276 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56715 Bond Arns 96504 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56716 d ock NHE187 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56717 Ruger 660- 38655 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56718 Ruger 572- 20324 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56719 North Anmerican Arms RS2615 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
56720 New Engl and NN239171 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56721 300 AAC Bl ackout GroC110871 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56722 Hubei Ji anghua (SDS | nports) LHO001333 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
56723 Bri gade 3042F UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
56724 Bai kal Russi a 0015337625B UA W 04/02/ 2024
56725 Norinco Poly US 24020847 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56726 Marlin Firearns 02184173 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56729 Mossber g MV0462931 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
56731 Snmith and Wesson TMD3200 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56733 Taur us ME26345 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56734 Smith & Wesson TBF2329 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
56736 Ber sa 127739 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
56737 Rossi F134740 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56738 Charter Arms 1076907 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56739 Smith & Wesson TAC7966 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
56740 Charter Arnms 993779 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
56742 Heckl er & Koch 25-023286 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56743 Col t 32519 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56744 Smith & Wesson J107163 UA W 04/02/ 2024
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56745 Charter Arns 796652 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
56746 Taur us HJ20972 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56747 Taur us FE40493 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56748 Taur us NC87214 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
56749 Taur us NNK17619 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
56751 Col t 220883 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56752 Col t 846192 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
56754 Col t 697331 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56756 H gh Standard 104664 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024
56757 Heckl er & Koch 125287 UA W 04/02/ 2024
56758 Smith & Wesson TCB9985 UA W 04/ 02/ 2024

Tot al

Asset s: 165
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